Joaquin Mavares

From: Scott Dieball

Sent: Tuesday, June 08, 2010 4:34 PM

To: Bergstrom, David (RR Energy Systems)

Cc: Jeff Canon; Joaquin Mavares; Chris Stratton; Cindy Howatt
Subject: RE: Contract Documents

Attachments: 20100608161823288.pdf; 20100608162041247.pdf

Here is the contract now executed by ProEnergy.

| am also sending to you by FedEx 2 original copies for execution and ask that you return one copy fully executed. Also,
plz be sure to insert the contract date.

We will initiate the wire of funds as soon as you get us a scanned signature on behalf of RR.
Regards,

Scott Dieball
Vice President, Business Operations

ProEnergy Services
616 FM 1960 West, Suite 750
Houston, Texas 77090
281-580-2111 direct
281-580-1112 fax
832-212-1645 cell
660-829-5100 office

http://www.proenergyservices.com

This e-mail is the property of ProEnergy Services, LLC and/or its relevant affiliate and may contain confidential and privileged material for the sole use of the intended recipient
(s). Any review, use, distribution or disclosure by others is strictly prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient (or authorized to receive for the recipient), please contact the
sender or reply to ProEnergy Services at chowatt@proenergyservices.com and delete all copies of the message. This e-mail (and any attachments hereto) are not intended to be an
offer (or an acceptance) and do not create or evidence a binding and enforceable contract between ProEnergy Services LLC (or any of its affiliates) and the intended recipient or
any other party, and may not be relied on by anyone as the basis of a contract by estoppel or otherwise. Thank you.

From: Bergstrom, David (RR Energy Systems) [mailto:david.bergstrom@rolls-royce.com]
Sent: Tuesday, June 08, 2010 12:12 PM

To: Scott Dieball

Subject: Contract Documents

Scott, attached are the contract documents as agreed. Please sign the clean copy and return for the RR
signature. Once RR signs | will forward to you.

Regards,
David Bergstrom

Rolls-Royce Energy Systems
832-277-7918



